MUSIC INSTRUMENTS
BID NO. 17-013

B.A.C. Meyer | Meyer | Music & Washington

Music Drumson | Explorers K.C. Lone Star Meyer Music Music Arts Nick Rail | Southwest Music
Item Description Qty. Center Sale Percussion | Strings | Percussion Music Alt. 1 Alt. 2 Center Music Strings Center
1 |Cello, 3/4, Soft Case and Bow 1 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid $733.00 No Bid $1,101.00 No Bid | $880.00 | $753.50 No Bid
2 |Cello, 4/4, Soft Case and Bow 1 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid | $1,035.00 No Bid $1,101.00 No Bid | $880.00 | $753.50 No Bid
3 |14" Viola, Thermoplastic Case and Bow 3ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid $951.00 No Bid $2,208.00 No Bid [ $1,380.00 | $1,079.40 No Bid
4 [3/4 Violin, Thermoplastic Case and Bow 3ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,854.00 No Bid |$1,191.00| $979.65 No Bid
5 |4/4 Violin, Thermoplastic Case and Bow 1 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $618.00 No Bid $386.00 | $326.55 No Bid

6 [French Horn 1 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,357.00 |%$2,450.00/%$2,563.00| $2,298.00 | $1,595.00 | No Bid $2,247.00

7 |Tenor Saxophone 2ea. | $1,540.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,532.00 $1,360.00 | $1,480.00| No Bid $1,470.00
8 [Sousaphone System Blue, 3-Valve 2 ea. | $13,400.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 |Mellophone 3ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,651.00 $3,597.00 | $3,720.00 | No Bid $3,477.00
10 |Primary Line Soprano Xylophone 2 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $673.40 No Bid $820.00 | $660.00 No Bid $700.00
11 [Primary Line Alto Xylophone 2 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $877.40 No Bid $1,070.00 [ $854.00 No Bid $900.00
12 |Gretsch Catalina 4 Piece Drum Set 1ea. No Bid $595.00 $669.00 No Bid $630.24 $689.00 No Bid $615.00 No Bid No Bid
13 |Pre-tuned Tobano Drums 6 ea. No Bid No Bid $870.00 No Bid No Bid $835.50 $810.00 | $759.00 No Bid $930.00

Pearl CarbonCore Championship Shallow-

14 |Cut Tenor Set-Quint 3sets| No Bid $3,599.55 | $4,107.00 No Bid $3,517.71 | $3,832.50 $3,516.00 | $3,582.00 | No Bid $3,414.00
14a |Tenor Carrier (for #14 above) 3ea. No Bid $662.70 $735.00 No Bid $677.16 $660.00 $687.00 | $624.00 No Bid $615.00
14b [Tenor Drum Cover (for #14 above) 3ea. No Bid $125.97 $165.00 No Bid $142.56 $139.50 $144.00 | $132.00 No Bid $129.00

15 |Snares, 14" x 12" Carboncore 5 ea. No Bid $3,054.80 | $3,375.00 No Bid $2,984.10 | $3,295.00 $2,980.00 | $3,035.00 | No Bid $2,900.00
15a [Snare CS Carrier (for #15 above) 5 ea. No Bid $990.85 | $1,075.00 No Bid $1,012.50 $987.50 $1,025.00 | $935.00 No Bid $920.00
15b (14" Snare Drum Cover (for #15 above) 5 ea. No Bid $152.15 $195.00 No Bid $172.80 $168.75 $175.00 | $160.00 No Bid $160.00
16 |Marching Bass Drum-16" 1 ea. No Bid $487.12 $565.00 No Bid $455.89 $502.75 $450.00 | $459.00 No Bid $438.00
16a |Bass Drum CX Carrier (for #16 above) 1 ea. No Bid $198.17 $215.00 No Bid $202.50 $197.50 $205.00 | $187.00 No Bid $184.00
16b |Bass Drum Cover (for #16 above) 1ea. No Bid $32.93 $43.00 No Bid $37.26 $36.50 $38.00 $34.00 No Bid $34.00
16¢ |Bass Drum Case (for #16 above) 1 ea. No Bid $75.88 $99.00 No Bid $83.48 $83.75 $87.00 $79.00 No Bid $78.00
17 |Marching Bass Drum-18" 1ea. No Bid $519.43 $605.00 No Bid $486.09 $534.95 $481.00 $490.00 No Bid $467.00
17a |Bass Drum CX Carrier (for #17 above) 1ea. No Bid $198.17 $215.00 No Bid $202.50 $197.50 $205.00 | $187.00 No Bid $184.00
17b [Bass Drum Cover (for #17 above) 1 ea. No Bid $32.93 $43.00 No Bid $37.26 $36.50 $38.00 $34.00 No Bid $34.00
18 |Marching Bass Drum-20" 1 ea. No Bid $554.72 $645.00 No Bid $514.01 $570.25 $513.00 | $523.00 No Bid $499.00
18a |Bass Drum CX Carrier (for #18 above) 1 ea. No Bid $198.17 $215.00 No Bid $202.50 $197.50 $205.00 | $187.00 No Bid $184.00
18b [Bass Drum Cover (for #18 above) 1 ea. No Bid $36.75 $48.00 No Bid $40.43 $40.75 $42.00 $38.00 No Bid $38.00
19 |Marching Bass Drum-22" 1 ea. No Bid $567.02 $665.00 No Bid $525.28 $582.25 $525.00 | $535.00 No Bid $510.00
19a |Bass Drum Carrier (for #19 above) 1ea. No Bid $198.17 $215.00 No Bid $202.50 $197.50 $205.00 | $187.00 No Bid $184.00
19b [Bass Drum cover (for #19 above) 1 ea. No Bid $36.75 $48.00 No Bid $40.43 $40.75 $42.00 $38.40 No Bid $38.00
20 [Marching Bass Drum-24" 1ea. No Bid $609.87 $715.00 No Bid $567.97 $624.95 $564.00 $575.00 No Bid $549.00
20a |Bass Drum Carrier (for #20 above) 1ea. No Bid $198.17 $215.00 No Bid $202.50 $197.50 $205.00 | $187.00 No Bid $184.00
20b [Bass Drum Cover (for #20 above) 1 ea. No Bid $39.50 $50.00 No Bid $44.82 $43.75 $46.00 $41.00 No Bid $41.00
21 |Marching Bass Drum-26" 1 ea. No Bid $650.04 $750.00 No Bid $602.21 $664.95 $601.00 | $613.00 No Bid $585.00
21a |Bass Drum Carrier (for #21 above) 1ea. No Bid $198.17 $215.00 No Bid $202.50 $197.50 $205.00 | $187.00 No Bid $184.00
21b [Bass Drum Cover (for #21 above) 1 ea. No Bid $41.99 $59.00 No Bid $47.52 $46.50 $48.00 $44.00 No Bid $43.00
22 |Baby Grand Piano 1 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Totals $13,400.00 | $595.00 0 $1,684.00 0 28,450.00 0.00 0.00 1,360.00 | 2,273.00 | 2,059.70 | $18,320.00
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